OFFICE OF THE AUDITOR, RALPH T. MEACHAM, CPA, AUDITOR
MAHONING COUNTY, OHIO
FORFEITED LAND SALE
1:00 P.M., WEDNESDAY, September 23, 2020

SALE RESULTS

Parcel # Location
Item #1. | *The following two (2) parcels must be sold together.
*16-023-0-001.00-0 ALLIANCE SEBRING RD
Smith Township Sold
*16-023-0-002.00-0 | 21537 ALLIANCE SEBRING RD
Item #2. | *The following two (2) parcels must be sold together.
*16-023-0-016.00-0 | 21562 ALLIANCE SEBRING RD
Smith Township Sold
*16-023-0-017.00-0 ALLIANCE SEBRING RD
Item #3. 16-047-0-004.00-0 1136 S JOHNSON RD Smith Township Sold
Item #4. 18-031-0-263.00-0 22863 NORMAN AVE Smith Township Sold
Item #5. 38-004-0-212.00-0 218 BROAD ST City of Struthers Sold
Iltem #6. | *The following three (3) parcels must be sold together:
*38-017-0-207.00-0 FIFTH ST
*38-017-0-208.00-0 FIFTH ST City of Struthers Sold
*38-017-0-209.00-0 FIFTH ST




Item #7. 38-018-0-345.01-0 3950 RILEY AVE City of Struthers Sold
Item #8. 38-019-0-387.00-0 439 EIGHTH ST City of Struthers Sold
Item #9. 38-031-0-042.00-0 W HARVEY ST City of Struthers Sold
Item #10. | *The following eight (8) parcels must be sold together.

*45-079-0-392.00-0 CREIGHTON AVE

*45-079-0-393.00-0 CREIGHTON AVE

*45-079-0-394.00-0 CREIGHTON AVE

*45-079-0-423.00-0 OVERLOOK AVE Coitsville Sold

. 0

*45-079-0-424.00-0 1302 OVERLOOK AVE Township

*45-079-0-425.00-0 OVERLOOK AVE

*45-079-0-426.00-0 OVERLOOK AVE

*45-079-0-427.00-0 OVERLOOK AVE

All parcels located in the City of Campbell were selected by the City of Campbell Land Reutilization Program and must be sold for

the opening bid amount.

Item #11. 46-008-0-285.00-0

103 BRIGHT AVE

City of Campbell

No Bid

Awarded To Campbell Landbank

Item #12. 46-018-0-189.00-0

600 PORTER AVE

City of Campbell

No Bid

Awarded To Campbell Landbank

All parcels located in the City of Youngstown were selected by the City of Youngstown Land Reutilization Program and must be

sold for the opening bid amount.

ltem #13. | 53-014-0-271.00-0 257 W DENNICK AVE City of No Bid Awarded to Youngstown Landbank
Youngstown

ltem #14. | 53-019-0-047.00-0 812 - 816 ANDREWS AVE City of No Bid Awarded to Youngstown Landbank
Youngstown




City of

Item #15. 53-054-0-406.00-0 345 CARROLL ST Sold
Youngstown
Item #16. | *The following two (2) parcels must be sold together.
*53-060-0-319.00-0 3443 NEILSON AVE City of
No Bid Awarded to Youngstown Landbank
*53-060-0-320.00-0 NEILSON AVE Youngstown
Item #17. 53-063-0-227.00-0 431 EDWARDS ST City of No Bid Awarded to Youngstown Landbank
Youngstown
Item #18. 53-076-0-540.00-0 HAYMAN ST City of No Bid Awarded to Youngstown Landbank
Youngstown
ltem #19. | 53-109-0-277.00-0 1330 HUMBOLT v City of No Bid Awarded to Youngstown Landbank
oungstown
Item #20. 53-118-0-374.00-0 HILTON AVE v City of No Bid Awarded to Youngstown Landbank
oungstown
Item #21. 53-119-0-018.00-0 2907 COTTAGE GROVE City of No Bid Awarded to Youngstown Landbank
Youngstown
City of
Item #22. 53-123-0-045.00-0 32 W. AVONDALE AVE Sold
Youngstown
City of
Item #23. 53-123-0-047.00-0 22 W AVONDALE AVE Sold
Youngstown
ltem #24. | 53-178-0-080.00-0 2208 CHERRY HILL City of No Bid Awarded to Youngstown Landbank

Youngstown




Item #25. | *The following three (3) parcels must be sold together.
*53-206-0-302.00-0 917 DEAN AVE
*53-206-0-303.00-0 DEAN AVE v City of No Bid Awarded to Youngstown Landbank
oungstown
*53-206-0-304.00-0 DEAN AVE
Item #26. 53-206-0-305.00-0 DEAN AVE City of No Bid Awarded to Youngstown Landbank
Youngstown
City of .
Item #27. 53-206-0-565.00-0 2031 STEWART ROAD Youngstown No Bid Awarded to Youngstown Landbank
ltem #28. | 53-242-A-050.00-0 2734 MT VERNON AVE City of No Bid Awarded to Youngstown Landbank

Youngstown




